
1104 	 Kenya Subsidiary Legislation, 2006 

J 

K and L 

M 

Shs. 50,000 for each year of 
validity or part thereof. 

Shs. 25,000 for each year of 
validity or part thereof. 

No fee (Gratis) 

(4) The Third Schedule to the Immigration Regulations is 	Sub-leg 

amended in subparagraphs b (i) by deleting the words "between 
the houts of 6.30a.m. and 6.30 p.m." and substituting the words 
" at any time" therefor. 

Dated the 10th November, 2006. 

G. S. KONCHELLA, 
Minister of State for Immigration and 

Registration of Persons. 

LEGAL NOTICE No. 166 

THE PUBLIC FEES ACT 

(Cap. 424) 

IN EXERCISE of•the powers conferred by section 2 of the 
Public Fees Act, the Minister of State for Immigration and 
Regitration of Persons makes the following Regulations— 

PUBLIC FEES (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS, 2006 

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Public Fees 
(Amendment) Regulations, 2006 and shall come into operation 
on 1st January, 2007. 

2. The Public Fees Regulations in these Regulations L.N. 74/1999. 

referred to as "the principal Regulations" are amended by 
deleting Regulation 2 and substituting the following new 
Regulation therefor— 

"2(i) The fees for issue of passport shall be— 

(a) three thousand shillings for a thirty-two page passport; 

(b) four thousand five hundred shillings for a forty-eight 
page passport; 

(c) six thousand shillings for a diplomatic passport; 

(d) three thousand shillings for a service passport; 

(e) nine hundred shillings for the East African passport. 



Kenya Subsidiary Legislation, 2006 	 1105 

(ii) A passport issued shall be valid for a period of ten 
years and shall not be renewable." 

3. Regulation 3 of the principal Regulations is amended 
by— 

(a) deleting the words "two thousand shillings" in sub-
paragraph (a) and substituting the words "three 
thousand shillings" therefor. 

(b) deleting sub-paragraph (b) and substituting the 
following new subparagraph therefor— 

"(b) the certificate of identity (CIN) issued shall not be 
renewable." 
4. Regulation 4 of the principal Regulations is amended by 

deleting the words "eight hundred shillings" and substituting the 
words "three hundred shillings" therefor. 

Dated the 10th November, 2006. 

G. S. KONCHELLA, 
Minister of State for Immigration and 

Registration of Persons. 

PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY THE GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NAIROBI 


